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The coverage in Supply Chain Management: A Balanced Approach is balanced
and uses a broad brush to encompass OM, purchasing, and distribution with a
supply chain management focus and covers a great deal of content that isn't
currently available. The book guides the reader through how all aspects of supply
chain activity are accomplished effectively and efficiently.
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Editorial Review

About the Author
Joel D. Wisner is Professor of Supply Chain Management at the University of Nevada, Las Vegas. Prior to
his academic career, he worked as an engineer in the oil industry in West Texas and the Louisiana Gulf
Coast. His research interests encompass quality assessment and improvement strategies along the supply
chain. Dr. Wisner also coauthored PROCESS MANAGEMENT, and his articles have appeared in numerous
journals, including JOURNAL OF BUSINESS LOGISTICS, JOURNAL OF OPERATIONS
MANAGEMENT, JOURNAL OF SUPPLY CHAIN MANAGEMENT, JOURNAL OF
TRANSPORTATION, PRODUCTION AND OPERATIONS MANAGEMENT, and QUALITY
MANAGEMENT JOURNAL. He earned his BS in Mechanical Engineering from New Mexico State
University, his MBA from West Texas State University, and his PhD in Supply Chain Management from
Arizona State University.

G. Keong Leong is Professor and MBA Director in the Lee Business School at the University of Nevada, Las
Vegas. He was previously a member of the faculty at Ohio State University and a clinical faculty at the
Thunderbird School of Global Management. In addition to coauthoring OPERATIONS STRATEGY:
FOCUSING COMPETITIVE EXCELLENCE and CASES IN INTERNATIONAL MANAGEMENT: A
FOCUS ON EMERGING MARKETS, Dr. Leong has published articles in numerous academic journals,
including JOURNAL OF OPERATIONS MANAGEMENT, DECISION SCIENCES, INTERFACES,
JOURNAL OF MANAGEMENT, EUROPEAN JOURNAL OF OPERATIONAL RESEARCH, and
INTERNATIONAL JOURNAL OF PRODUCTION RESEARCH. He received the Educator of the Year
award from the Asian Chamber of Commerce in Las Vegas; the Dennis E. Grawoig Distinguished Service
award from Decision Sciences Institute; and the OM Distinguished Scholar award from the Operations
Management Division, Academy of Management. Active in the Decision Sciences Institute, he has served as
president, DECISION LINE editor, at-large vice president, associate program chair, Innovative Education
Committee chair, Doctoral Student Affairs Committee chair, and Manufacturing Management Track chair. In
addition, Dr. Leong served as president of the Western Decision Sciences Institute and chair of the
Operations Management Division, Academy of Management. He received an undergraduate degree in
Mechanical Engineering from the University of Malaya and an MBA and PhD from the University of South
Carolina.

Keah-Choon Tan is Associate Dean of Academic Affairs and Professor of Operations Management in the
Lee Business School at the University of Nevada, Las Vegas. Prior to academia, Dr. Tan was a hospital
administrator and an account comptroller of a manufacturing firm. He holds certifications in purchasing
management (CPM) and production and inventory management (CPIM). In addition to serving as editor, as
co-guest editor, and on the editorial boards of academic journals, he has published articles in the areas of
supply chain management, quality, and operations scheduling in numerous academic journals, including
DECISION SCIENCES, DECISION SUPPORT SYSTEMS, INTERNATIONAL JOURNAL OF
PRODUCTION RESEARCH, INTERNATIONAL JOURNAL OF OPERATIONS & PRODUCTION
MANAGEMENT, INTERNATIONAL JOURNAL OF LOGISTICS MANAGEMENT, JOURNAL OF
SUPPLY CHAIN MANAGEMENT, and OMEGA. Dr. Tan has received several research grants and
teaching awards, including the UNLV Foundation Distinguished Teaching Award. He received a BSc degree
and an MBA from the University of South Alabama and a PhD in Operations Management from Michigan
State University.



Users Review

From reader reviews:

Bruce Zimmerman:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be change about what going on or details even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era and that is always change and advance. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to you
is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Principles of Supply Chain Management: A
Balanced Approach is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, because this book
serves what you want and need in this era.

Rhonda Yowell:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the name Principles of Supply
Chain Management: A Balanced Approach suitable to you? Often the book was written by renowned writer
in this era. Often the book untitled Principles of Supply Chain Management: A Balanced Approachis a single
of several books in which everyone read now. This particular book was inspired many men and women in
the world. When you read this book you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know ahead of. The
author explained their thought in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to comprehend the core of
this book. This book will give you a lots of information about this world now. So you can see the represented
of the world with this book.

Lou Marshall:

You could spend your free time to learn this book this e-book. This Principles of Supply Chain Management:
A Balanced Approach is simple to create you can read it in the park, in the beach, train as well as soon. If
you did not have got much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is
make you quicker to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a
lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Michael Watkins:

On this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
precious than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple approach to have that.
What you should do is just spending your time very little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books.
Among the books in the top checklist in your reading list is definitely Principles of Supply Chain
Management: A Balanced Approach. This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you
closer in growing to be precious person. By looking way up and review this book you can get many
advantages.
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