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Editorial Review

From Publishers Weekly
Baker's self-indulgent novel, a 14-week PW bestseller in cloth, transcribes a long telephone conversation
between two people who meet over a phone-sex call-in line. Author tour.
Copyright 1993 Reed Business Information, Inc.

From Library Journal
Jim and Abby meet over the phone when they both dial one of those 976 party lines that are advertised in
adult magazines. After some exploratory small talk, they retire to the electronic "back room" for a more
intimate chat. Their long conversation makes up the entire book. If the premise sounds a bit thin, remember
that Nicholson Baker's brilliant first novel The Mezzanine ( LJ 11/1/88) was about an office worker's lunch-
hour expedition to buy new shoelaces. Like all great artists, Baker has the ability to make familiar objects
and everyday events seem new and strange. Centerfolds, lingerie catalogs, and X-rated videos will never
look the same. Indeed, Vox transforms the genre itself: this is eroticism for the safe-sex Nineties. Not only is
there no physical contact, the participants never leave the privacy of their own homes. Recommended, with
the caveat that some readers may find the subject matter offensive. Baker's Room Temperature ( LJ 3/15/90)
was one of LJ 's "Best Books of 1990" ( LJ 1/91).--Ed.
- Edward B. St. John, Loyola Law Sch. Lib., Los Angeles
Copyright 1991 Reed Business Information, Inc.

From Kirkus Reviews
On a private adult phone-sex line, Jim, a West Coaster in his late 20s, connects with East Coast Abby. Birds
of a feather--both of them witty, obsessive, yuppie masturbators--they're off, trading stories and fantasies and
the psychopathologies of everyday life. Baker (The Mezzanine, Room Temperature), heretofore more a
monologist, a literary performance artist, than much of a novelist, folds his deadpan honesty and funny
fussiness double--and though Jim and Abby finally seem so much like the same voice that they don't really
qualify as characters, they don't have to: Baker has found a conceptual format, the phone sex, perfectly
tailored to his talents. This is a mini-epic of Big Chill--ed safe-sex: rambling stories that start out as aids to
titillation but dry and crumble into homely and self-satisfied details that challenge eroticism; the overturning
of classical seduction theory (here, both the man and woman, unseen to each other, know that the other has
his/her hand on his/her self); lots of little snappy apercus and joshings establish intellectual coziness. The
tropes of modern sex--olive oil, VCRs, copying machines, the letters in Penthouse Forum--are traded
breezily, sometimes hilariously, but are nothing compared to the main technological thrill; after Abby tells
him exactly how she masturbates in the shower, Jim (in the book's best and most concentrated moment)
declares it a miracle, ```a telephone conversation I want to have. I love the telephone.''' And Baker does
expose a strange kind of dignity, in that Jim and Abby aren't using each other for very much more than as
instruments of exemption from embarrassment. Quite a literary season for self-relief! First Harold Brodkey
as the Mahler, the Liszt, of the hand-job, now Nicholson Baker as its David Letterman. -- Copyright ©1991,
Kirkus Associates, LP. All rights reserved.

Users Review

From reader reviews:



Brian Alexander:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the guide entitled Vox. Try to make the book Vox as your pal. It means that
it can for being your friend when you sense alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than ever
before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you far more confidence because you can know
almost everything by the book. So , we should make new experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Kimberly Niemeyer:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive at this point, people
have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the idea for a while is reading.
Sure, by reading a guide your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand than other is high. For
yourself who want to start reading the book, we give you this Vox book as basic and daily reading
publication. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Bertha Morrison:

This Vox is great e-book for you because the content and that is full of information for you who also always
deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This book reveal it information accurately using
great arrange word or we can say no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have
whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward sentences but difficult core
information with splendid delivering sentences. Having Vox in your hand like having the world in your arm,
facts in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no publication that offer you world within ten or
fifteen second right but this e-book already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. busy
do you still doubt in which?

Marianne Stromain:

Publication is one of source of know-how. We can add our information from it. Not only for students and
also native or citizen want book to know the up-date information of year to help year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the
world. From the book Vox we can get more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? Being creative
person must prefer to read a book. Only choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't end up being
doubt to change your life with this book Vox. You can more desirable than now.
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