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Editorial Review

Review
"The last few years have seen the publication of many fantasies, but few have the appeal of this original
story.”—Booklist, starred review, on The Ruins of Gorlan

About the Author
John Flanagan grew up in Sydney, Australia, hoping to be a writer. John began writing Ranger’s Apprentice
for his son, Michael, ten years ago, and is still hard at work on the series and its spinoff, Brotherband
Chronicles. He currently lives in the suburb of Manly, Australia, with his wife. In addition to their son, they
have two grown daughters and four grandsons.
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1.

It had been a long, hard three days.

Will had been on a tour of the villages surrounding Castle Redmont. It was something he did on a regular
basis, keeping in touch with the villagers and their headmen, keeping track of the everyday goings-on.
Sometimes, he had learned, little pieces of gossip, seemingly trivial at the time, could become useful in
heading off future trouble and friction within the fief.

It was part of being a Ranger. Information, no matter how unimportant it might seem at first glance, was a
Ranger’s lifeblood.

Now, late in the afternoon, as he rode wearily up to the cabin set among the trees, he was surprised to see
lights in the windows and the silhouette of someone sitting on the small verandah.

Surprise turned to pleasure when he recognized Halt. These days Will’s mentor was an infrequent visitor to
the cabin, spending most of his time in the rooms provided for him and Lady Pauline in the castle.

Will swung down from the saddle and stretched his tired muscles gratefully.

“Hullo,” he said. “What brings you here? I hope you’ve got the coffee on.”

“Coffee’s ready,” Halt replied. “Tend to your horse and then join me. I need to talk to you.” His voice
sounded strained.

Curiosity piqued, Will led Tug to the stable behind the cabin, unharnessed him, rubbed him down and set out
feed and fresh water. The little horse butted his shoulder gratefully. He patted Tug’s neck, then headed back
to the cabin.



Halt was still on the verandah. He had set out two cups of hot coffee on a small side table and Will sat in one
of the wood-andcanvas chairs and sipped gratefully at the refreshing brew. He felt the warmth of it flowing
through his chilled, stiff muscles. Winter was coming on and the wind had been cold and cutting all day.

He gazed at Halt. The gray-bearded Ranger seemed strangely ill at ease. And despite his claim that he
needed to talk to Will, once the usual greetings were out of the way, he seemed almost reluctant to begin the
conversation.

“You had something to tell me?” Will prompted.

Halt shifted uncomfortably in his seat. Then, with an obvious effort, he plunged in.

“There’s something you should know,” he said. “Something I probably should have told you long ago. It’s
just . . . the time never seemed right.”

Will’s curiosity grew. He had never seen Halt in such an uncertain mood. He waited, giving his mentor time
to settle his thoughts.

“Pauline thinks it’s time I told you,” Halt said. “So does Arald. They’ve both known about it for some time.
So maybe I should just . . . get on with it.”

“Is it something bad?” Will asked, and Halt looked directly at him for the first time in several minutes.

“I’m not sure,” he said. “You might think so.”

For a moment, Will wondered if he wanted to hear it, whatever it might be. Then, seeing the discomfort on
Halt’s face, he realized that, good or bad, it was something that his teacher had to get off his chest. He
gestured for Halt to continue.

Halt paused for a few more seconds, then he began.

“I suppose it starts after the final battle against Morgarath’s forces, at Hackham Heath. They’d been
retreating for several days. Then they stopped and made a stand. We’d broken their main attack and we were
forcing them back. But they were rallying on the right, where they’d found a weak point in our line . . .”

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Luis Martin:

As people who live in often the modest era should be revise about what going on or info even knowledge to
make these keep up with the era which is always change and progress. Some of you maybe can update
themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems coming to you is you
don't know what type you should start with. This The Lost Stories: Book 11 (Ranger's Apprentice) is our
recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and
need in this era.



James Miguel:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information presently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a problem. What people must be consider
when those information which is inside the former life are challenging be find than now's taking seriously
which one is appropriate to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you get the unstable resource
then you obtain it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities
will not happen in you if you take The Lost Stories: Book 11 (Ranger's Apprentice) as your daily resource
information.

Geraldine Davis:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always try and and must have the time or they will get large
amount of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do you
have when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then
do you try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, typically
the book you have read is usually The Lost Stories: Book 11 (Ranger's Apprentice).

Arlene Farmer:

Book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen require book to know the change information of year to help year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the
world. By the book The Lost Stories: Book 11 (Ranger's Apprentice) we can get more advantage. Don't you
to be creative people? To get creative person must like to read a book. Merely choose the best book that ideal
with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life with that book The Lost Stories: Book 11
(Ranger's Apprentice). You can more appealing than now.
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