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Editorial Review

Review

Choice Outstanding Academic Title 2006

'As a professor of 19th-century literature as well as a prolific science fiction writer, Roberts is eminently
qualified to write a history of the genre. This impressive tome is ambitious in its scope, tracing SF's origins
back to the fantastic voyages of the ancient Greek novel - the original Vernean voyages extraordinaires.' -
The Guardian

'Adam Roberts' 'History' is the most significant history of the genre since The Trillion Year Spree by Brian
Aldiss and David Wingrove, published nearly two decades ago, and demonstrates the most original thinking
about science fiction since Kingsley Amis's New Maps of Hell more than forty years ago. This isn't merely
an excellent historical survey but a narrative, showing compellingly how modern science fiction has roots in
the fantastic-voyage tales of antiquity, and has been shaped by a dialectic between magic and materialism
that dates back to the Reformation...Adam Roberts is already a proven author of high-quality science fiction.
With 'History' he establishes himself as the most important critical voice in modern science fiction studies.' -
Stephen Baxter, Current Vice President, The British Science Fiction Association and Author of Timelike
Infinity and Voyage

'[A] refreshingly irreverent attempt to look at science fiction without blinkers.' - Strange Horizons

'The History of Science Fiction is a necessary and important book. It will get people talking, discussing and -
dare I say it? - arguing about all manner of things relevant to science fiction, its history and its future.' -
Green Man Review

'...the lasting impressions left by this History of Science Fiction are of the author's eye for detail, his
understanding of the pervasiveness of the science fiction in contemporary culture, and his astonishing critical
energy.' - Patrick Parrinder, The British Society for Literature and Science

Review

“This immensely readable critical survey combines a strong thesis with engaged, provocative and often
highly original accounts of an astonishing range and variety of texts. Now thoroughly revised and updated, it
makes an indispensable contribution to literary history.” (Patrick Parrinder, Emeritus Professor, University of
Reading, UK)

“The revised edition of Professor Roberts's History of Science Fiction is a truly comprehensive history of
European and American SF.  The second edition preserves most of the major arguments and interpretations
from the first, and adds a wealth of new material. This is likely to become the standard work in the field.”
(Lewis W. Call, author of “BDSM in American Science Fiction and Fantasy”)

“Roberts’s deft anatomisation of the evolution of science fiction, from deep roots in Ancient Greek literature
to its present preeminence in popular culture, is remarkably wide-ranging and marvellously detailed. A
meticulous, entertaining, essential critical resource.” (Paul McAuley, author of “Fairyland, The Quiet War,



and Into Everywhere”)

From the Back Cover
This book is the definitive critical history of science fiction. The 2006 first edition of this work traced the
development of the genre from Ancient Greece and the European Reformation through to the end of the 20th
century. This new 2nd edition has been revised thoroughly and very significantly expanded. An all-new final
chapter discusses 21st-century science fiction, and there is new material in every chapter: a wealth of new
readings and original research. The author’s groundbreaking thesis that science fiction is born out of the
17th-century Reformation is here bolstered with a wide range of new supporting material and many hundreds
of 17th- and 18th-century science fiction texts, some of which have never been discussed before. The
account of 19th-century science fiction has been expanded, and the various chapters tracing the twentieth-
century bring in more writing by women, and science fiction in other media including cinema, TV, comics,
fan-culture and other modes.

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Pearl McLean:

This The History of Science Fiction (Palgrave Histories of Literature) book is absolutely not ordinary book,
you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is definitely
information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper you read a lot of
information you will get. This The History of Science Fiction (Palgrave Histories of Literature) without we
recognize teach the one who looking at it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't become
worry The History of Science Fiction (Palgrave Histories of Literature) can bring whenever you are and not
make your tote space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even
mobile phone. This The History of Science Fiction (Palgrave Histories of Literature) having great
arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Anthony Collins:

The actual book The History of Science Fiction (Palgrave Histories of Literature) will bring someone to the
new experience of reading any book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. When you try to
find new book to see, this book very ideal to you. The book The History of Science Fiction (Palgrave
Histories of Literature) is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book through the
official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Kayla Wilson:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you can have
it in e-book approach, more simple and reachable. This The History of Science Fiction (Palgrave Histories of
Literature) can give you a lot of close friends because by you checking out this one book you have matter
that they don't and make anyone more like an interesting person. This book can be one of one step for you to
get success. This reserve offer you information that probably your friend doesn't know, by knowing more
than some other make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? Let me have The History of Science Fiction



(Palgrave Histories of Literature).

Robert Tanaka:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many question for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some
people likes studying, not only science book but also novel and The History of Science Fiction (Palgrave
Histories of Literature) as well as others sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the
fantastic a book, you feel want to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher as well as
students especially. Those books are helping them to bring their knowledge. In other case, beside science
guide, any other book likes The History of Science Fiction (Palgrave Histories of Literature) to make your
spare time more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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